
Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices Vendor Number: 1784575 Vendor
Name: Crespo Collective

Check Details:
Check Number: E0110326 Check Amount: $ 700.00 Check Date:
11/4/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: 011 Invoice Date: 10/28/2025 PO Number: P0020112
Voucher Number: V0911044

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below
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Wed, Oct 29, 2025 at 03:23 PM UTC

"White, Princess" <whitep144@cod.edu>

Crespo Collective Payment

"White, Princess" <whitep144@cod.edu>

CC: Zerrudo, Marivic <zerrudom@cod.edu>

BCC:

Hello,

 

Can you please process for payment. Services have been completed by Nadine Crespo at Crespo Collective.

 

Thank you,

 

Princess White

Administrative Assistant for InterCultural Student Initiatives

College of DuPage

InterCultural Student Initiatives | 425 Fawell Blvd |Glen Ellyn, IL 60137|630-942-2644

 

1 attachment

Crespo Collective Payment.pdf





From: Sekerka, Joyce
To: Zerrudo, Marivic
Subject: RE: Crespo Collective Payment
Date: Wednesday, October 29, 2025 11:14:29 AM
Attachments: image002.png

Hi Marivic,
 
Yes, good question. This one is a bit tricky. Since she is an individual/sole proprietor, she can also
use a Tax ID number. The Tax ID number must match the name on line 1 of the W-9, which is
Nadine Crespo Garcia. So, this should be okay.
 
 
 

 
Thanks,
Joyce
 
Joyce Sekerka
Accounts Payable Supervisor
College of DuPage
425 Fawell Blvd.
Glen Ellyn, IL  60137-6599
630-942-2293
Email: sekerkaj@cod.edu

 
From: Zerrudo, Marivic <zerrudom@cod.edu> 
Sent: Wednesday, October 29, 2025 10:49 AM
To: Sekerka, Joyce <sekerkaj@cod.edu>
Subject: FW: Crespo Collective Payment

 
Hi Joyce,
 
Need you assistance please.
 
Princess White submitted an invoice in CR under business name Crespo Collective (vendor



1784575), but the invoice is under Nadine Crespo.
She created a PO for this invoice.  This is a new vendor. 
Shouldn’t the name on the invoice show Crespo Collective instead of Nadine Crespo?
 
 
Thank you
 
Marivic Zerrudo
Accounts Payable Specialist
College of DuPage
425 Fawell Blvd l SRC 2132 l Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599
phone 630-942-2601 l zerrudom@cod.edu

 
From: White, Princess <whitep144@cod.edu> 
Sent: Wednesday, October 29, 2025 10:35 AM
To: Zerrudo, Marivic <zerrudom@cod.edu>
Subject: RE: Crespo Collective Payment

 
Nadine is the name of the individual but her llc is Crespo Collective. Vendor number 1784575.
 
Thanks,
 
Princess White
Administrative Assistant for InterCultural Student Initiatives
College of DuPage
InterCultural Student Initiatives | 425 Fawell Blvd |Glen Ellyn, IL 60137|630-942-2644
 
From: Zerrudo, Marivic <zerrudom@cod.edu> 
Sent: Wednesday, October 29, 2025 10:33 AM
To: White, Princess <whitep144@cod.edu>
Subject: FW: Crespo Collective Payment

 
Princess,
 
We are going to have an issue with this because the invoice is under Nadine Crespo Garcia
(individual)
P0020112 in under Crespo Collective (vendor)
 
Can you forward the updated W9?
 
 
Thanks
 
 
Marivic Zerrudo
Accounts Payable Specialist
College of DuPage
425 Fawell Blvd l SRC 2132 l Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599
phone 630-942-2601 l zerrudom@cod.edu

 
From: White, Princess <whitep144@cod.edu> 
Sent: Wednesday, October 29, 2025 10:23 AM
To: Invoicing <invoicing@cod.edu>
Cc: Zerrudo, Marivic <zerrudom@cod.edu>



Subject: Crespo Collective Payment

 
Hello,
 
Can you please process for payment. Services have been completed by Nadine Crespo at Crespo
Collective.
 
Thank you,
 
Princess White
Administrative Assistant for InterCultural Student Initiatives
College of DuPage
InterCultural Student Initiatives | 425 Fawell Blvd |Glen Ellyn, IL 60137|630-942-2644
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